
 

 

 
                      May 25, 2022 

 
 
IWPA Circular No.1 of 2022-23 
 
 
(For the attention of all members having Captive 
Generating Plants in Tamil Nadu) 
 
 

Dear Member, 
 
 

Sub: Verification of CGP Status for FY 2021-22 
 

This is further to our Circulars No. 9 of 2020-21 dated October 23, 2020 and No. 13 of 2020-21 dated November 
28, 2020 regarding CGP verification.  
 
Members who are yet to submit documents to their respective SEs at the Consumption end for the purpose of 
verification of Captive Generating Plant status for FY 2021-22 are required to do so on or before May 31, 2022.  
In line with Order No. RA 7 of 2019 dated January 28, 2020 and Order No. MP 24 of 2020 dated 07.12.2021 
passed by the Tamil Nadu Electricity Regulatory Commission, particulars are: 
 
 Where a member owns 100% of one or more WEGs situated in one or more generating circle and uses it for 

own captive purposes at one consumption point, both generation and consumption data is to be submitted IN 
AGGREGATE for all the machines, even if each WEG has a separate HTSC number. The documents can be 
submitted at the SE EDC of the consumption end. Copy of the acknowledgement(s) issued by the SE EDC of 
the consumption end for submission of documents may be submitted with a covering letter to the SE EDC of 
the generating circle. 
 

 Where a member owns 100% of one or more WEGs under one legal entity situated in one or more EDCs 
(generating circle) and consumes it at multiple HTSC in one or more EDCs for own captive purposes, data is 
to be submitted IN AGGREGATE of all WEGs at the consumption end to the SE EDC where the member has 
maximum consumption. A copy thereof may also be submitted to the other consumption end SEs for their 
information and record. Copy of the acknowledgement issued for submission of documents may be submitted 
with a covering letter to the SE EDCs of the generating circle from where notices were issued as a proof for 
submission of documents and obtain acknowledgement or send it by RPAD. 
 

 Group captive generators having one or more WEG installed in one or more EDCs and having one or more 
captive user, data is to be submitted in Aggregate at the generating end EDC where maximum installed 
capacity of the CGP are located. Acknowledgment should be obtained while submitting the documents. Where 
notices have been received from more than EDC calling for documents and particulars, copy of the 
acknowledgement may be submitted to other EDCs as well. 
 

 Members may please note that the Hon’ble Commission has directed to provide details in Aggregate and 
hence members may aggregate the generation from all WEGs and consumption of each captive user for the 
whole year and submit accordingly. Members are also advised to get the acknowledgement of the documents 
or send it by RPAD and keep the Acknowledgment safely. 

 
                    Thanking you,          

          Yours faithfully 
                                                                                                                  For Indian Wind Power Association 

 
(Prof. Dr. K. Kasthurirangaian) 

Chairman 


